BID TABULATION SHEET

Town Undergrounding
Phase 1 South
Job #: 016885.100

PROJECT LOCATION: West Palm Beach, FL

CATEGORY NAME: MECHANICAL

PROJECT NAME: Town Undergrounding South PAGE 1 OF 1

PREPARED BY:LB

REVIEWED BY:MMY

MPANY V. Engineerin: & Murray Logan 5 TLC Diversified AM Construction Energy Efficient Elec. d B Enterprise | | Akerblom Construction
CONTACT Felix Valdis Kurt Kapsos Dalas Lamberson [ Abel Menedez [ Rene Viau I Mike Bessent Jeanne Akerblom
PHONE 305) 342-5568 561) 686-3948 7] 27) 417-7235 455 561) 262-7833 2 561) 655-7211 B 561) 662-8450 { 954) 792-3599
[ 3 3
A-dl A a3 NO BID b
% o
Expressed interest in B
Schﬂlu!o Si Vakies: - “oooool] D'dding during initial NO BID NO BID e
Mobilization/Demobilization $15,000.00 - $36,000.0018 - solicitation - —
lhﬂﬁna::r::?:;::: s:igggg - sf;ggg: =1 Did not turn in bid on = Expressed interest inf= Expressed interest in = DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO BID
on b . b, -
,000. ,000.00(8% d | PR T PROJECT
Temporary By-Pass Pumping $51.200.00] $77.700.00] bid day bidding ?u‘rlng initial P bidding during initia i OJEC OJEC
Continuous Temp. Supply/Exhaust Fans and Wetwell $8,000.00f $5,300.00] s soRcitetion solciation e
[Mechanical improvements $115,100.00] $142,115.00 S”br":’eld;c;"pi’ia' for i S— O P—— NO REASON NO REASON
Trench Drain/MH Connections $5,000.00] % e f' ;:13 goo i ' ”Ob :';‘ In bid on jigg Ul ”°b ; d"' 000
Door Replacement $1,200.00| mount of $943, o any Ky,
Site Restoration/Repairs $2,000.00] . (Mech & Elec I
Startup/Commissioning $3,000.00 $3,000.00 Combined - Highest [&= ;
Bidder) L = I
Schedule of Values Subtotal $215,000.00] $297,115.00 $0.00 so.ooi I $0.00/ $0.00 $0.00
|Bid Review Adjustment: 4 [
Remove/Transpor/Replace Pumps $12,700.00] included|
Rewiring of Pumps [HI §$22,800.00 I it s
Provide temp power for own scope & i & i
Credit for RTU Scope/Coordination (In electrical scope) $0.00] ($7,150.00) |5 I b "
P 3 e
Bid Review Adjustment Subtotal $35,500. -$7,150.00 $0.00, $0.00| $0.00| $0.00) $0.00
- o i L s
| 1 | & | 3 | i | | | : |
REQUESTED i £ u
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BID TABULATION SHEET
Town Undergrounding PROJECT NAME: Town Undergrounding South PAGE 1 OF 1
Phase 1 South PROJECT LOCATION: West Palm Beach, FL PREPARED BY:LB
Job#: 016885.100 CATEGORY NAME: ELECTRICAL REVIEWED BY:MMY
OMPANY Il_I[ Current Connections CR Dunn Energy Efficient Elec. Powerline of SF i Paragon Electron 3
ONTACT | B Rich Mirabilio Malcolm Rogers Rene Viau Tom Laessig Tom Granims Al Laessig
PHONE L 561) 863-0010 561) 585-2155 561) 655-7211 561) 575-4270 (772) 569-8961 (561) 744-1388
A-41 PUMP STATION [ ] 1 53
| SCOPE REVIEW: ELECTRICAL ] 2] W B
Schedule of Values: NO B : NoEp : : :
[IMobilization/Demobilizati ,000.00| ,000. £i%y , S % .
B:n:::dolnsurancel zeron :; ggggg ::mgg Expressed interest in = Expressed interest = DECLINED TO BID | DECLINED TO [
,900. ,420. : i e \ . f
A4 Cloctrical Demolilion $10,300.00 $5,300.00] blddl;]ogllgl:gltllglmlllal : u: ll);?(:lnﬂf[ju;lﬂ? ] PROJECT :: BID PROJECT :
[A-41 Temporary Power/Lighting Excluded] $12,000.00 : I By At B iocicicn B wosiey B
A-41 Electrical Improvements $100,800.00| $112,500.00] Did not t in bid .__ Did not t in bid s B 4
A-41 New Transformer and Eleclrical Services $3,300.00f $4,700.00 il .urn In bid on (ERLId No .um LING O e 4 :';1
bid day Ea bid day i ey
A-41 Instrument & Controls $146,700.00f $125,000.00 | fd = [
|A-41 Site Restoration/Penetration Repairs Excluded $6,500.00 ; : S
|— L —s —
Schedule of Values Subtotal $267,000.00 $276,420.00) $0.00| $0.00| $0.00| $0.00
Bid Review Adjustment:
Included
A-41 Temporary Power/Lighting $12,000.00 Above
A ) Included
A-41 Site Restoration i $6,500.00 | Above
Bid Review Adjustment Subtotal $18,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 B A
REQUESTED X
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|Phase 1 South
Jobi#: 016885-100

Town Undergrounding South

BID TABULATION SHEET

PROJECT NAME: Town Undergrounding South
PROJECT LOCATION: West Palm Beach, FL
CATEGORY NAME: ROOFING

PAGE 1 OF 1

PREPARED BY:LB

REVIEWED BY:MMY

COMPANY Hi-Tech Roofing Roofing | ¢ Atias Roofin| Mark Terlep Roofin, Weath h Il Embick Roofin, i
CONTACT Jarred Felton John Julien [ Pete Kessel i Mark Tt A
PHONE (561) 586-3110 = 54) 800-4072 B 154) 422-5544 =) (561) 641-2228 54) 292-1862 561) 748-0434 &
£ & 1% =
A-41 PUMP STA’ NO BID 82" | &)
: - et -
IEched e of Values Expressed interest DECLINED TOBID B DECLINED TO BID DECLINED TO =
- JEC e QJEC PROJECT
0 - = - $1.500.00] " in hlddmg‘dunng PROJECT % PROJECT BID PROJEC -
nd and Insurance $600.00| Included| MWIE souctiason 8 . ]
fing $25,455.00 $19.200.00] = NO REASON ‘.-‘ NO REASON NO REASON. [=9
#9 Did not turn in bid on|# ] o
g bid day = —
Schedule of Values Subtotal $27,565.00 sn.:oo.sz w.ool so.oob w.ool $0.00
Bid Review Adjustment: + § - y A
Bid Review Adju Subtotal] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
| = ] | | : | |
REQUESTED FE |7 1
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