### **Attorneys and Counselors** Flagler Center Tower, Suite 1100 505 South Flagler Drive P.O. Box 3475

### West Palm Beach, Florida 33402-3475

(561) 659-3000

IRS# 59-1292566

John C. Randolph P.O. Box 3475 West Palm Beach, FL 33402

March 27, 2018 Invoice No. 207446 File No. 06165.00048 **JCR** 

State of Florida Commission on Ethics Complaint No. 15-182 (

#### **TOTALS FOR THIS STATEMENT**

	<u>RATE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
JOHN C. RANDOLPH	250.00	10.00	\$2,500.00
KELSEY E. MEANY	200.00	8.20	\$1,640.00
MATTHEW G. FRIAS	250.00	1.80	\$450.00
SCOTT G. HAWKINS	250.00	39.80	\$9,950.00
TOTAL FEE THIS INVOICE			\$14,540.00
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED THIS IN	VOICE		\$631.64
TOTAL CHARGES THIS INVOICE		•	\$15,171.64
PREVIOUS BALANCE			\$0.00
TOTAL ACCOUNT BALANCE			\$15,171.64

Randolph, John C. State of Florida Commission on Ethics Complaint No. 15-182 ( March 27, 2018 Invoice No. 207446 File No. 06165.00048 Page 2

#### FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

<u>DATE</u>	INDV	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
10/08/15	MGF	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ASSIGNMENT FROM J. RANDOLPH RE WEEKS ETHICS COMPLAINT. REVIEW TOWN MINUTES.	0.60	150.00
10/08/15	SGH	REVIEW MINUTES, LEGAL ISSUES RE: TOWN ATTORNEY.	0.20	50.00
10/09/15	MGF	REVIEW WEEKS COMPLAINT	0.50	125.00
10/09/15	MGF	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. HAWKINS , J. RANDOLPH , AND K. RIZZARDI RE WEEKS COMPLAINT AND STRATEGY RE ETHICS INVESTIGATION RESPONSE.	0.70	175.00
10/09/15	SGH	REVIEW COMPLAINT, PROCEDURAL POSTURE, STRATEGY, MEETING WITH J. RANDOLPH.	0.40	100.00
11/02/15	JCR	REVIEW FILES AND PREPARE DRAFT LETTER TO VIRLINDIA DOSS	1.00	250.00
01/12/17	JCR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROBERTO ANDERSON-CORDOVA RE: ETHICS ISSUE	0.20	50.00
01/12/17	JCR	REVIEW FILE AND CORRESPOND TO ROBERTO ANDERSON-CORDOVA	0.50	125.00
01/23/17	JCR	REVIEW FILE IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEW WITH ROBERTO ANDERSON CORDOVA	l 0.40	100.00
01/24/17	SGH	REVIEW STRATEGY WITH J. RANDOLPH.	0.20	50.00
01/24/17	JCR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HAWKINS	0.20	50.00
01/24/17	JCR	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH ROBERTO ANDERSON-CORDOVA	1.50	375.00
02/27/17	JCR	CORRESPONDENCE TO ROBERTO ANDERSON-CORDOVA RE: ONGOING INVESTIGATION	0.20	50.00
06/19/17	SGH	REVIEW ETHICS COMMISION FILING, LETTER, M. COOPER CALL.	0.60	150.00
06/19/17	JCR	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ETHICS INVESTIGATION REPORT	0.40	100.00
06/20/17	KEM	Met with S. Hawkins, did legal research for claim against J. Randolph	1.80	360.00
06/20/17	JCR	REVIEW ORDER AND CONSULT WITH S. HAWKINS	0.80	200.00

Randolph, State of Fl		nmission on Ethics Complaint No. 15-182 (	Invoice	rch 27, 2018 No. 207446 06165.00048 Page 3
06/20/17	JCR	ATTENTION TO ETHICS COMPLAINT	0.40	100.00
06/20/17	SGH	REVIEW RELATED WEEKS FILINGS, SUMMARY JUDGMENT, STATEMENT, STRATEGY RE: RESPONSE.	1.30	325.00
06/21/17	KEM	RESEARCH wrote memo for S. Hawkins regarding complaint against J. Randolph for Town of Palm Beach ethics complaint	3.30	660.00
06/26/17	SGH	REVIEW RESEARCH COMPLAINT , INVOICES, REPORT, FULFORD EMAIL EXTENSION, LETTER TO MILLIE FULFORD.	0.80	200.00
06/27/17	JCR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DANIELLE OLSON AND MEETING WITH S. HAWKINS	0.20	50.00
06/27/17	SGH	REVIEW RESPONSE DEADLINE, FACTUAL ISSUES, STATUTE.	0.20	50.00
06/29/17	JCR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DANIELLE OLSON AND S. HAWKINS	0.20	50.00
06/29/17	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DANIEL OLSON, JCR.	0.20	50.00
06/30/17	SGH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAILS FROM D. OLSON, OLSON NOTES.	0.20	50.00
06/30/17	SGH	REVIEW WEEKS NOTICE OF TERMINATION, INVESTIGATIVE REPORT.	0.80	200.00
07/03/17	SGH	REVIEW COMPLAINT, INVESTIGATIVE REPORT, STATUTES.	0.50	125.00
07/03/17	SGH	PREPARE INITIAL DRAFT RESPONSE.	2.40	600.00
07/05/17	SGH	REVIEW OLSON REPORT RE: WEEKS AND COMPUTER RESOURCES, D. SZARSZEWSKI REPORT, COURT ORDER.	1.30	325.00
07/05/17	SGH	REVIEW STATUTES, RESEARCH.	0.50	125.00
07/05/17	SGH	PREPARE DRAFT RESPONSE.	1.70	425.00
07/05/17	KEM	RESEARCH question on probable cause definition by ethics commission for s. hawkins	3.10	620.00
07/06/17	JCR	REVIEW AND MODIFY RESPONSE TO ETHICS COMPLAINT	1.40	350.00
07/06/17	SGH	REVIEW J. RANDOLPH NOTES, REVISIONS, STATUS, REPORT.	0.90	225.00
07/06/17	SGH	PREPARE REVISED DRAFT RESPONSE.	2.60	650.00

Randolph, State of F		nmission on Ethics Complaint No. 15-182 (	Invoice	rch 27, 2018 No. 207446 6165.00048 Page 4
07/07/17	JCR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HAWKINS	0.20	50.00
07/07/17	JCR	REVIEW RESPONSE TO ETHICS COMPLAINT	0.80	200.00
07/07/17	SGH	REVIEW ADDITIONAL REVISIONS, FOLLOW UP WITH J. RANDOLPH.	0.20	50.00
07/09/17	JCR	REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO ETHICS COMPLAINT	1.00	250.00
07/10/17	SGH	REVIEW EXHIBITS TO DRAFT RESPONSE, DISMISSAL NOTICE.	0.40	100.00
07/10/17	SGH	PREPARE AFFIDAVIT, REVISE RESPONSE.	1.10	275.00
08/09/17	SGH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW COMMISSION LETTER, ADVOCATES RECOMMENDATION.	0.30	75.00
08/10/17	SGH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ADVOCATES RECOMMENDATION RE PROBABLE CAUSE, STRATEGY RE HEARING.	0.20	50.00
08/15/17	SGH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ADVOCATE RECOMMENDATIONS, HEARING SCHEDULE.	0.20	50.00
08/15/17	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILLIE FULFORD, COMMISSION CLERK.	0.20	50.00
09/01/17	SGH	REVIEW FOR HEARING, RESPONSE, REPORT, ADVOCATE'S RECOMMENDATION.	1.20	300.00
09/01/17	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY HADLEY.	0.20	50.00
09/01/17	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILLIE FULFORD, ETHICS COMMISSION.	0.20	50.00
09/05/17	SGH	REVIEW FILE, HEARING PREP.	0.30	75.00
09/05/17	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILLIE FULFORD, COORDINATOR, COMMISSION HEARINGS.	0.20	50.00
09/05/17	SGH	PREPARE MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE.	0.50	125.00
09/06/17	SGH	REVIEW REVISED MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE.	0.20	50.00
09/06/17	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILLIE FULFORD.	0.20	50.00
09/06/17	SGH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM MILLIE FULFORD, RESPONSE SENT.	0.20	50.00
09/15/17	SGH	REVIEW HEARING SCHEDULE, CORRESPONDENCE RE MOTION, PLANNING.	0.20	50.00

Randolph, State of Flo		mission on Ethics Complaint No. 15-182 (	Invoice	arch 27, 2018 e No. 207446 06165.00048 Page 5
10/25/17	SGH	REVIEW COMMISSION CORRESPONDENCE NOTICE RE: HEARING, SCHEDULE.	0.20	50.00
11/20/17	SGH	REVIEW HEARING ISSUES, SCHEDULE, CONTINUANCE.	0.20	50.00
11/21/17	SGH	RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM V. DOSS, COMMISSION, NOTICE RE HEARING CHANGE.	0.20	50.00
02/28/18	SGH	REVIEW FILINGS FOR COMMISSION HEARING	0.60	150.00
02/28/18	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FULFORD, ETHICS COMMISSSION, RE: HEARING	0.20	50.00
02/28/18	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ASSISTANT ATTORNEY GENERAL MELODY HADLEY RE: HEARING	0.20	50.00
02/28/18	SGH	REVIEW RESPONSE	0.80	200.00
03/07/18	SGH	REVIEW TOWN INVESTIGATIVE REPORT - HEARING PREP.	0.30	75.00
03/08/18	SGH	REVIEW TOWN INVESTIGATION REPORT PRIOR RULINGS AS TO WEEKS; PREP FOR HEARING; WEEKS DOCS, PROVIDE.	6.30	1,575.00
03/09/18	SGH	PREPARE FOR HEARING IN Tallahassee, TRAVEL TO UPD.	9.50	2,375.00
03/09/18	JCR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HAWKINS RE: RESULTS OF ETHICS HEARING	0.20	50.00
03/12/18	SGH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND TO COMMISSION COORDINATING FULFORE RE: ORDER.	0.20	50.00
03/14/18	SGH	REVIEW FINAL ORDER OF DISMISSAL, EMAIL FOLLOW-UP WITH COMMISSION CLERK, ETC.	0.30	75.00
03/14/18	JCR	RECEIVE AND REVIEW PUBLIC REPORT OF ETHICS COMMISSION DISMISSING CASE	0.20	50.00
03/15/18	JCR	CORRESPONDENCE TO KIRK BLOUIN	0.20	50.00
		TOTAL HOURS	59.80	
COSTS ADVANCED				

<u>DATE</u>		<u>AMOUNT</u>
03/15/18	CHECK: TRAVEL EXPENSE TRAVEL TO TALLAHASSEE TO ATTEND COMMISSION HEARING 3/8-3/9/18 - SCOTT CG. HAWKINS	631.64
		\$631.64