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Date:  October1, 2017
To: All Perspective Participants

From: Steve Casey, Executive Director
Sarrah Glassner, Deputy Executive Director
Annette Grissom, CPP Manager
Greg Tish, CPP Coordinator

Re: Contract Number FSA17-VEL25.0 Police Rated, Administrative, Utility Vehicles, Trucks and Vans

We are pleased to announce that the Florida Sheriffs Association has successfully completed its 25th nationwide
cooperative bid for vehicles. This contract is in effect beginning October 13, 2017 through September 30, 2018.

This year’s bid includes 63 specifications and 215 makes and models. It offers police rated, special service,
administrative, hybrid vehicles, pick-up trucks, vans, mobility transport and police motorcycles.

The competitive process for this award began in January 2017, when stakeholders were surveyed regarding
procurement needs. Specifications were developed based on prior year activity and new additions were added based
on survey results and the Fleet Advisory Committee’s review of commodities.

On April 10, 2017, a direct notification was sent to 511 prospective bidders to register for qualification to participate in
the bid process. An advertisement of the Invitation to Bid was placed within the Florida Administrative Weekly on June
1, 2017 and again on June 20, 2017. From this Invitation to Bid, 41 bidders responded. Of these respondents, 25 bidders
submitted bids and 23 bidders were awarded after a review by the FSA Fleet Advisory Committee.

The Florida Sheriffs Association Cooperative Purchasing Program has followed the Contract Terms and Conditions to
procure this contract, and requires that all users, both purchasers and awarded vendors comply as well.

Contract prices are extended and guaranteed to any local government or political subdivision of the state, public
educational institutions, other public agencies or authorities with the State of Florida, and entities approved by the
manufacturer to participate in this contract.

Out of state sales are permitted under this contract. All purchasers are bound by their local governing purchasing
ordinances, rules and regulations.

All awarded vendors are governed by their manufacturer agreements and the Contract Terms and Conditions.

List of Awards for FSA17-VEL25.0 Police Rated, Administrative, Utility Vehicles, Trucks and Vans:
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac
Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula

Alan Jay Ford Lincoln




Alan Jay Nissan, Inc.

Alan Jay Toyota

Auto Nation Chevrolet Pembroke Pines

Auto Nation Nissan Pembroke Pines

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines

Bartow Ford

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep Ram

Beck Auto Sales, Inc.

Bruce's Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley Davidson

Coggin Ford

Duval Ford LLC

Garber Chevrolet Buick GMC Inc.

Garber Chrysler Dodge Jeep Inc

Garber Ford

Kelley Buick GMC, Inc

Prestige Ford

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales

Stingray Chevrolet LLC

Tampa Truck Center LLC

Terry Taylor's DeLand Nissan
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Name of Dealership

HARLEY-DAVIDSON POLICE MOTORCYCLE

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Bruce Rossmeyer's Daytona Harley-Davidson

Type of Vehicle Zone
ification #09

2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) * Western
2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) Western
2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) * Northern
2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) Northern
2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) * Central
2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) Central
2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) * Southern
2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) Southern
2018 Harley Davidson Electra Glide Western
(FLHTP)
2018 Harley Davidson Electra Glide Western
(FLHTP)

i li
?gﬁg%;l;ley Davidson Electra Glide Northern

i li
?gﬁg%;l;ley Davidson Electra Glide Northern
2018 Harley Davidson Electra Glide Central
(FLHTP)
2018 Harley Davidson Electra Glide Central
(FLHTP)
2018 Harley Davidson Electra Glide Southemn
(FLHTP)
2018 Harley Davidson Electra Glide Southemn

(FLHTP)

Base Unit
Price

$18,000.00
—-NB --
$17,750.00
—-NB --
$17,750.00
—-NB --
$18,000.00
—-NB --
$18,500.00
—-NB --
$18,250.00
—-NB --
$18,250.00
—-NB --

$18,500.00

—-NB --
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HARLEY-DAVIDSON POLICE MOTORCYCLE
SPECIFICATION #9

2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP)
2018 Harley Davidson Electra Glide (FLHTP)

THE FOLLOWING ITEMS WILL BE FACTORY INSTALLED ON THE BASE VEHICLE TO
MEET THE MODEL NUMBER AND BUILD CODES OF THE VEHICLE LISTED. PLEASE
REFER TO THE EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND SIRENS SECTION WITHIN
THIS CONTRACT FOR DESCRIPTIONS, SPECIFICATIONS AND AWARDED VENDOR
PRICING.

1. ENGINE:

. Single Cam design

. Compression ratio: 10.0:1

. Electronic Sequential Port Fuel Injection System (ESPFI)

. Hydraulic Lifters requiring no maintenance service adjustments

. Piston Displacement of not less than 17 46¢cc Milwaukee-Eight™ 107 cubic inch, pushrod-operated, overhead valves
with hydraulic, self-adjusting lifters, four valves per cylinder and featuring EITMS (Engine Idle Temperature
management System), producing minimal vibration frequencies and magnitudes. Engine and Transmission isolated
from motorcycle frame utilizing rubber mounting system.

f. Powertrain deluxe chrome group designed for low maintenance; black powder coat finish on engine; chrome rocker

boxes, timer cover, outer primary and transmission Covers..
g. Air and Oil cooled.
h. Fan assisted oil cooler

2. CLUTCH/TRANSMISSION:

a. Hydraulic actuated clutch system for both FLHP and FLHTP

b. Clutch shall be of the latest multiple nine (9) plate design, wet.

¢. Clutch disengage for starter motor operation.

d. Gear Ratios 1s1-9.593 2nd-6.650 3rd-4.938 4th-4.000 5th-3.407 6th-2.875

e. Greaseless shifter shaft with "anti-vibration" rubber spacers.

f. Primary Drive, double-row chain, 34/46 ratio.

g. Transmission to be of latest design, manual type, with not less than six (6) forward speeds.

3. BRAKES:

a. Brakes shall be relatively free of heat fade.

b. Calipers-4 Piston.

c. Front brakes having dual 11.81-inch diameter floating discs

d. Hydraulic Disc brakes for both front and rear wheels.

¢. Rear brake having a single disc.

f. Reflex™ Linked Braking with ABS, linking disengages below 25 mph.
g. Uniform Expanding Rear Rotor.

o0 O

4. SUSPENSION:
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a. Motorcycles shall be provided with a suspension system to permit optimum handling conditions as required in |\
enforcement.

b. Front suspension uses Showa Dual Bending Valve (SDBV)

¢. Hand adjustable emulsion shocks.

d. Rear suspension swing arm bearings shall require no lubrication for life of the motorcycle.

5. WHEELS/TIRES:

a. Black Impeller™ Cast Aluminum wheels, rim material to be impermeable to compressed air.

b. Tubeless type tires to have non-skid tread, designed to operate on paved highways and shall have a full, four-ply fabric
reinforcement. Bead-retention tires designed to remain on wheel during sudden loss of pressure.

¢. Sealed automotive style wheel bearings requiring no endplay adjustment and service interval of 100,000 miles
(160,000 km).

6. FUEL TANK:

a. Electric fuel pump.
b. Fuel tank to have a capacity of six (6) U.S. gallons (or 22.71 liters). Must provide a minimum of 1 gal (3.8 L) reserve
fuel capacity when main supply is exhausted.

7. ELECTRICAIL SYSTEM:

a. Battery. Sealed, heavy-duty maintenance-free, 12-volt, minimum rated capacity — 28 ampere hours (Battery Council
International rating), 270 cold cranking amps.

b. Connectors. Industrial grade throughout, provided with electrical accessory connection.

¢. Charging System. Three-phase, 50-amp high output alternator, solid state regulator.

d. Hand Controls. Water-resistant, integrated switches.

¢. Horn. Sound level audible above motorcycle and traffic-generated noise.

f. Ignition. Non-waste spark, alpha control.

g. Starting System. 12-volt starter, solenoid operated engagement, relay required.

8. LIGHTING SYSTEM.

a. Flashers, four-way, with independent switch.

b. Front Emergency Lamps PAR-36, one red and one blue (incandescent).

c. Fender tip running lights, amber in front, red in the rear.

d. (FLHP)- Dual Halogen Headlight.(FLHTP)- Daymaker™ LED Headlight.

¢. (FLHP)- Rear (Red) LED Fender Tip Light (FLHTP)- Front (Amber) and Rear (Red) LED Fender Tip Lights
f. License plate lighting with two blue marker lamps.

g. Tail light.

h. Turn Signals, self-canceling system.

9. VISUAL DISPLAYS:

. ABS indicator lamp

. Cruise Control indicator

. Engine diagnostic light

. Fuel level gauge.

Gear Indicator

. Emergency Light Activation Indicator, separate indicators for front and rear emergency lights.

. Fuel Mileage countdown till empty displayed in odometer window when Low fuel indicator lamp is lit.
. Hazard-Warning Lights Indicator

. High beam Indicator

. Low Oil pressure Indicator

. Neutral Indicator

. Odometer. Calibrated, cumulative.

. Sight glass on brake master cylinders.

. Speed Capture with Digital Speed Display

. Speedometer. Analog & Digital speedometer, range 0-120mph (or kph equivalent).(2) re-settable trip meters.
. Security Lamp (if equipped with optional security system)

. Stealth Mode indicator-if activated

. Tachometer. Analog.

. Turn Signal Indicators

w iR T OB E LR PR 0 R0 T
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"EATURE REQUIREMENTS:

a. Analog and Digital Speed Display with Speed Capture feature

b. Chrome, two into one into two exhaust system

¢. Cruise Control-OE standard

d. Final belt drive, with a rubber isolated 68 tooth rear drive sprocket.

e. (FLHP)Dry Weight. 786 Ibs. (357 kg.) (FLHTP) Dry Weight. 791 Ibs. (359 kg.)

f. (FLHP) Running Order. 821 Ibs. (372 kg.) (FLHTP) Running Order. 826 lbs. (375 kg.)

. Foot Boards. pivoting type with non-skid rubber pads
Gear Indicator

. Gross Vehicle Weight Rating. 1360 Ibs. (617 kg.)

. Guards. Front engine guard bar and rear saddlebag guard bars. (Saddlebag rails optional)

. Laden Seat Height. 27.3 inches (695 mm)

. Key. One key fits all locks.

. Mirrors. Two (2) long stem true image mirrors.

. Power ON for emergency equipment for 30 minutes with ignition OFF

. Push to Talk Switch-requires other police radio equipment not supplied by H-D

. Seat. Deluxe solo saddle, special police type, breathable material covering, adjustable coil over spring suspension
system.

. Service Intervals. 1st 1000 miles and then every 5000 miles thereafter.

. Stealth Mode-optional activation

. Side Stand. Jiffy stand with electronic disengage to prevent drive off with jiffy stand deployed.

. Saddlebags. Factory installed, law enforcement type Injection Molded GTX saddlebags, approx. 2000 cubic inches of
storage space per bag, water-resistant, utilizing one touch operation latches.

. Windshield. Constructed of clear polycarbonate, designed to break away with minimal force.

. Wheelbase. 64 inches (1625 mm).

. Model FLHP is windshield only.

. Model FLHTP is duct fairing with windshield.

S OEE R - B0
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11. WARRANTY:

a. Warranty: 24 months (unlimited mileage)
b. Service Interval: First 1000 miles; every 5000 miles thereafter — both models.

DISCLOSURE: THE FLORIDA SHERIFEFS ASSOCIATION WORKING IN CONJUNCTION
WITH MANUFACTURERS, VENDORS AND DISTRIBUTORS OF VEHICLES/EQUIPMENT

DOES THEIR BEST TO ENSURE MODEL NAMES, NUMBERS AND CODES REPRESENT

THE LATEST INFORMATION AVAILABLE AT THE TIME THE BID DOCUMENTS ARE

PREPARED. IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT YOU CONFIRM THIS INFORMATION WITH

THE AWARDED VENDOR REPRESENTATIVE AT THE TIME YOU ARE REQUESTING A

CONFIRMING QUOTE.
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HARLEY-DAVIDSON POLICE MOTORCYCLE
SPECIFICATION #9

2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP)

The Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: * Western * Northern * Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $18,000.00 $17.750.00 $17.,750.00 $18,000.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Road King (FLHP)

Bruce Rossmeyer's Bruce Rossmeyer's Bruce Rossmeyer's Bruce Rossmeyer's
Daytona Harley-Davidson Daytona Harley-Davidson Daytona Harley-Davidson = Daytona Harley-Davidson
ZONE: * Western * Northern * Central * Southern
BASE PRICE: $18,000.00 $17,750.00 $17,750.00 $18,000.00
Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

53196-09 ! Adapter plate for mounting Tour Pak $125.00"
65989-97C 1 | Auxiliary battery $175.00"
54178-10 ! Black Tour Pak without holes $1,000.00"
69940-10 ! Blue LED light for Tour Pak $300.00"
54180-10 ! Black pre-drilled Tour Pak for LEDs $1,500.00"
72641-10 ! Chrome trim ring for LED light $25.00"
69251-04 1 Engine guard pursuit lamps one red and one blue $850.00"
69250-04 1 Pursuit Lamps one red and one blue $750.00"
69816-10 ! Red LED light for Tour Pak $300.00"
69941-10 ! Red/Blue split LED light for Tour Pak $300.00"
90200561 ' Saddlebag guard rails $350.00"
Solid color paint (other than birch white or vivid black) $750.00
Two-Tone paint $1,000.00
69000057 | Whelen electric siren, amplifier and microphone $1.300.00"
54179-10 ' White pre-drilled Tour Pak for LEDs $1,500.00"
54177-10 ! White Tour Pak without holes $1,000.00"
Temporary tag $25.00
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number) $135.00
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.) $150.00
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HARLEY-DAVIDSON POLICE MOTORCYCLE
SPECIFICATION #9

2018 Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP)

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Harley Davidson Road King (FLHP) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the
manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this
contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment
items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to
vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which
allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost
of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you
wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the
approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when
preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those
listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.
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Road King (FLHP) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southem
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- --No bid --
Order Code Add Options All Zones

Options are to be discounted below Manufacturer’s Standard Retail
Pricing (MSRP) or manufacturers published list price for any factory
add options. Purchasers are encourage to negotiate pricing for
options. Additional discounts for each add option shall be decided by
the Vendor. Please refer to the Contract Terms and Conditions,
Section 2.14 Option Pricing.

53196-09 ! Adapter plate for mounting Tour Pak
65989-97C 1 | Auxiliary battery
54178-10 ' | Black Tour Pak without holes
69940-10 ! Blue LED light for Tour Pak
54180-10 ' Black pre-drilled Tour Pak for LEDs
72641-10 ! Chrome trim ring for LED light
69251-04 1 Engine guard pursuit lamps one red and one blue
69250-04 Pursuit Lamps one red and one blue
69816-10 ! Red LED light for Tour Pak
69941-10 ! Red/Blue split LED light for Tour Pak
90200561 ! Saddlebag guard rails
Solid color paint (other than birch white or vivid black)
Two-Tone paint
69000057 ! Whelen electric siren, amplifier and microphone
54179-10 ' White pre-drilled Tour Pak for LEDs
54177-10 1 White Tour Pak without holes
Temporary tag
Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)
New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)
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